
 

 

     
  

 

  

 

         
      

       
       

       
     

  

 
        

      
        

       
   

 
         

 

        
        

      
       

         
       

       
        

   

          
      

       
       

      
   

      
       

       
       

      
      

        
      

  
  

   

structures of any kind are permiƩed to be 
erected on the Subjects without licensors’ 
prior wriƩen consent. 

Property Services - Estates Team 
Place Directorate 

estates.enquiries@fife.gov.uk 

maintaining the fences and gate(s) that 
bound the Subjects. The successful applicant 
shall be responsible for the control of weeds 
(including but not limited to ragwort). 

TO LET 
EQUINE/GRAZING LICENCE 

STAR OF MARKINCH 
LOCATION 

This site is located in Star of Markinch, a 
small village located between Markinch and 
Kennoway in central Fife. The Subjects are 
located to the rear of Drum Terrace/Main 
Street (follow KY7 6LF) and comprise 0.23 
hectares (0.57 acres) or thereby. 

LOCATION PLAN 

USE 

The Subjects are offered for the grazing of 
horses & ponies and/or livestock. No 

TERMS 

The licence will be for a maximum of 350 
days. 

If let under an equine licence, the Subjects 
are not let as agricultural land and the 
licensee is expressly prohibited from using 
the Subjects for agriculture or the purposes 
of a trade or business as defined by SecƟons 
93 of the Agricultural Holdings (Scotland) Act 
2003 and 85(1) of the Agricultural Holdings 
(Scotland) Act 1991 or any other trade or 
business whatsoever. 

If let under a grazing licence, it is one to 
which SecƟon.3 of the Agricultural Holdings 
(Scotland) Act 2003 (“the Act”) applies and 
confers upon the licensee no security of 
tenure or other statutory protecƟon under 
the Act. 

Applicants should inspect the Subjects and 
saƟsfy themselves as to their condiƟon and 
suitability of the Subjects for their intended 
use. The licensee shall be responsible for 
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IMPORTANT NOTICE 

The Council does not bind itself to accept 
the highest or any offer for the Subjects. In 
supplying these parƟculars, the Fife Council 
is not issuing instrucƟons and will not, 
therefore, bear liability for agents or other 
fees. 

Please address any quesƟons through 
www.publiccontractsscotland.gov.uk by 
searching noƟces with Fife Council as the 
buyer and “grazing” as the keyword to find 
the noƟce for this opportunity. It will be 
necessary to register as a supplier to submit 
an offer. For any quesƟons about using the 
website, please contact the helpdesk on 
0800 222 9003, Monday to Friday 8.30 am 
to 5 pm. 

The successful party will be noƟfied in the 
week following the closing date. These 
parƟculars are believed to be correct but are 
supplied for informaƟon only and intending 
parƟes should saƟsfy themselves as to their 
accuracy. They are not deemed to form any 
contract or part of any contract, which may 
be entered into. 

CLCLOSING DATE 

Offers must be submiƩed through www.publiccontractsscotland.gov.uk by 

12 noon, Monday 25th November 2024 

 

    

 

 

  
      

  

  
         
      

  
       

      
         
       

        
       

        
   

   
      

      
       
     

   
      

 

         
    

 

 

 

 

 

  

  

  

   

        
         

      
       

       
 

 

     
  

       
        

        
        

        
      

        
   

 

        
      

        
      

       
        

        
    

  

  

       

      

SERVICES 

Mains water and electricity are not 
available. 

LICENCE FEE 

A licence fee will be payable in advance or 
as agreed. VAT currently zero rated. 

RATEABLE VALUE 

At the date these parƟculars have been 
prepared, the Subjects were not entered 
into the ValuaƟon Roll. If you wish to verify 
this, then please contact the Fife Assessor 
by email to fife.assessor@fife.gov.uk or by 
telephone on 03451 555 533. The Licensee 
will be responsible for the payment of any 
business rates. 

STATUTORY CONSENT 

The licensee will be responsible for 
obtaining any statutory consents which may 
be required in connecƟon with the intended 
use of the Subjects. 

SUBMISSION OF OFFERS 

Offers should be submiƩed through 
www.publiccontractsscotland.gov.uk. 

It will be necessary to register as a supplier 
before submiƫng an offer. 

www.publiccontractsscotland.gov.uk

